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 M E M O R A N D U M 
                                                   EUGENE WATER & ELECTRIC BOARD  

 
 

TO:    Commissioners Carlson, Barofsky, McRae, Schlossberg, and Brown 

FROM: Jason Heuser, Public Policy and Government Affairs Director              

DATE:  May 26, 2023 (June 6, 2023, Board Meeting) 

SUBJECT:  State Legislative Session Update 

OBJECTIVE:  Information  
 
 
Issue 
The 2023 State Legislative Session convened January 23, 2023.  This memo is to apprise the Board 
of key issues of interest to EWEB, and the current status of these issues in the legislative process. 
    
Background 
Prior to the start of each legislative session, the Board adopts general policy directives for advocacy 
at the Capitol, which guide the work of EWEB's lobbying activities.  When political considerations test 
the applicability of those directives, the General Manager decides as to whether a fundamental shift 
in direction is required.  The Board may be asked to reaffirm its policy or direct staff to make necessary 
adjustments. 
 
Discussion 
 
Legislators Walkout 
 
Beginning May 3rd, Senate Republicans have staged an ongoing “walkout” that prevents a sufficient 
quorum of legislators to do business, including voting on legislation, in protest of a set of bills Senate 
Republicans deem overly partisan and/or illegal under Senate rules.  Under the Oregon Constitution, 
the Senate requires that two-thirds of the chamber must be present to hold a floor session.  This is a 
high standard, and is only in place in three other states in the U.S.  The 46 other states have a simple 
majority as a standard for a quorum.  Measure 113, which passed in 2022 with 68% of the vote, bars 
any legislator with more than 10 unexcused absences from running for re-election.  Measure 113 has 
not proven to be a deterrent to walkouts and as of May 26th, 10 Republican Senators are disqualified 
under Measure 113 from serving another term (some Senators have terms that run through 2026, 
others have terms running through the end of 2024).  Measure 113 is expected to be challenged in 
court in the future. 
 
Nearly all the EWEB policy and budget priorities summarized in previous board correspondence 
session updates are in limbo along with over 200 other policy bills awaiting Senate action and the 
approval of a 2023-25 state budget.  In the event the Senate cannot achieve a quorum and no budget 
is passed, state services will be funded through a previously approved continuing resolution (existing 
funding/service levels) until September 15. Prior to that date, the Legislature will have to convene to 
approve a budget in special session. 
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Revenue Forecast 
 
The June Economic and Revenue Forecast was released last week, presented to members of the 
House Revenue Committee and Senate Finance and Revenue Committee, showed continued 
economic growth and income tax returns exceeding expectations. Available resources to the state 
climbed dramatically since the last forecast, with a $1.9 billion increase in available general fund 
revenue.   
 
State economists are still concerned about the risk of a recession, which typically follows a period of 
high inflation, but feel the risk is not imminent.  The revenue forecast means that state budget writers 
will have more leeway to increase investments in state and local funding priorities. 
 
Recommendation 
This memo is for informational purposes.  No board action is requested. 
  
Requested Board Action 
This memo is for informational purposes.  No board action is requested.  
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 M E M O R A N D U M 
                                                   EUGENE WATER & ELECTRIC BOARD  

 
 

TO:    Commissioners Carlson, Barofsky, McRae, Schlossberg, and Brown 

FROM: Karen Kelley, Chief Operations Officer; Deborah Hart, Chief Financial Officer; 
Mike Masters, Water Operations Manager; and Wally McCullough, Water 
Engineering Supervisor  

DATE:  May 22, 2023 

SUBJECT:  Water System Development Charges – Change in Charge Basis 

OBJECTIVE:  Information  
 
 
Issue 
Housing affordability is an issue statewide and several legislative efforts are under way to reduce the 
costs associated with home ownership.  An item discussed in several of these efforts is System 
Development Charges (SDCs) and how/when they are applied.  In Eugene, SDCs are applied to new 
development by EWEB for water service, and by the City for stormwater, wastewater, parks, and 
transportation.  
 
The SDC methodology review currently underway at EWEB provides an opportunity to not only 
update the fee with respect to current capital improvements but also review the basis for the charges 
to ensure alignment with current Board direction. 
  
Background 
EWEB currently applies SDCs to all new water services and additional demands placed on the water 
system.  The SDC consists of reimbursement, improvement, and administration charges. The 
reimbursement charge is based on the value of unused system capacity and is determined by 
establishing the existing water system plant value and the current system capacity available for future 
development. The improvement charge is based on the projected water demand necessary to serve 
future growth and the projected cost of corresponding system improvements identified in EWEB's 
Water System Capital Improvement Plan. The administration charge covers costs associated with 
accounting, billing, collection, and periodic review.    These SDC charges are reviewed and adjusted 
periodically per Oregon Revised Statutes requirements. 
 
Since 1997 these charges have been based on meter size with the thought that the larger the meter 
the higher the charge due to the greater demand placed on the system.  The SDC calculations are 
based on a standard 5/8-inch meter and charges for other meter sizes determined on the flow 
capacity equivalency to a 5/8-inch meter.   
 
Other than periodic changes in charge amounts, little changed with the way EWEB charged SDCs 
between 1997 (when they were first implemented) and 2016 (the time of the last comprehensive SDC 
methodology update).  As a result of the 2016 update, higher charges were added for the upper-level 
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zones in the system. Minor changes were made in 2019 when the 5/8-inch and ¾-inch meter charges 
were combined into a single <1-inch meter charge due to the characteristics of the new AMI meters.  
In addition, in 2019, given an interest in housing affordability the Board approved the ability to 
calculate SDC charges for accessory dwelling units less than 800 sf – resulting in a lower charge for 
these small units where a new service is provided. 
 
Discussion 
Meter size, is not particularly effective in recognizing the diversity of water use within the single-family 
residential class, given that most homes are served by the smallest standard meter.  A home’s square 
footage is a closer proxy for demand on the water system.   
 
In addition to better reflecting actual water demand, going to a scaled SDC structure will support 
housing affordability.  The result would be lower SDC charges for smaller homes and higher charges 
for larger homes. Charges calculated on home square footage balance affordability and equity 
objectives, with the need to fund infrastructure. 
 
Numerous alternatives are available to accomplish this, however, changing to residential square foot 
basis for single family residential would be consistent with the City of Eugene and the application of 
their wastewater SDCs.  This change will require little extra effort as EWEB will use the same data 
set as the City uses for their wastewater SDCs. 
 
This change in SDC structure will only impact the single-family residential class.  SDC charges for all 
other classes (commercial, industrial, apartments, multi-family residential) will continue to be based 
on meter size.    

  

Requested Board Action 
There is no requested board action at this time.  Management will bring changes to the SDC rate 
structure to the board in the fall in conjunction with the regularly scheduled rates hearings.  
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